
1. Three-Act Structure 

Yes, Good Will Hunting follows a discernible three-act structure. 

• Act 1: Inciting Incident - Will solves a complex math problem on a chalkboard in MIT’s 
classroom (Page 4). This marks the inciting incident, where Will’s latent genius is 
revealed. 

• Plot Point 1 - Will is arrested after getting into a fight (Page ~11). This event propels him 
into a new world of therapy and mentorship with Professor Lambeau and Sean. 

• Midpoint - Will agrees to start therapy with Sean (Page ~29). This is the turning point 
where Will starts to open up and face his emotional wounds. 

• Plot Point 2 - Will pushes Sean away, unable to handle his emotional breakthroughs 
(Page ~83). This "all is lost" moment sets up Will’s final confrontation with his past. 

• Climax - Will confronts his own fears about relationships and leaves Boston to pursue a 
life with Skylar (Page ~107). This is the final, cathartic change in Will’s journey. 

2. Protagonist Description 

• Adjectives: Brilliant, guarded, self-destructive. 

• Scene 1 (Brilliant): Will solves the complex math problem in the MIT classroom, 
showing his intellect (Page 4). 

• Scene 2 (Guarded): In the bar, Will shuts down a confrontation with a wealthy student, 
demonstrating his resistance to vulnerability (Page 57). 

3. Protagonist's Character Arc 

• Will moves from being a self-sufficient, emotionally closed-off genius to someone who is 
willing to face his past and open up to relationships and growth. 

• Scene 1 (Initial State): Will’s dismissive attitude toward therapy when first meeting Sean 
(Page 37). 

• Scene 2 (Transformation): Will’s emotional breakthrough during the therapy session 
with Sean where he finally lets his guard down (Page 94). 

4. Subplot 

• Subplot: Will’s relationship with Skylar, which adds emotional depth and conflict to his 
arc. 

• Act: This subplot starts in Act 1. 

• Scene 1: Will meets Skylar at the bar, and they hit it off (Page 18). 



• Scene 2: Will pushes Skylar away after learning she’s leaving for medical school (Page 
83). 

• Scene 3: Will decides to follow Skylar, symbolizing his emotional growth (Page 91). 

• This subplot intersects with the A story by showing how Will’s personal relationships 
help drive his emotional development and his eventual decision to take control of his life. 

5. Plot Point 2 

• Plot Point 2: Will’s emotional confrontation with Sean, where Will refuses to face his 
past and pushes everyone away (Page 105). This marks the lowest point for Will and 
propels him toward the climax. 

6. Climax 

• Compelling Climax: Yes, the climax is compelling. It is Will deciding to leave Boston to 
pursue a future with Skylar, signaling his growth. 

• Final Battle: It is figurative, not literal. The final battle is Will confronting his own fears 
about vulnerability and the future. 

• New Action: Will is able to take this leap because he has opened up emotionally, 
something he couldn’t have done earlier in the story. 

7. Emotionally Satisfying Ending 

• Yes, the ending is emotionally satisfying. Will’s decision to leave Boston and pursue his 
future with Skylar demonstrates that he’s finally overcome his emotional barriers. The 
story closes on a note of hope and personal growth. 

8. Why Was the Screenplay Nominated for an Academy Award? 

• Good Will Hunting was nominated for its poignant portrayal of emotional and intellectual 
growth, paired with sharp, witty dialogue. The screenplay delves deeply into themes of 
self-worth, trauma, and the impact of mentorship, which resonated with audiences and 
critics alike. 

9. Useful Aspect for My Own Work 

• The balance between character-driven and plot-driven moments is something I found 
useful. The screenplay integrates character growth seamlessly with plot progression, 
especially through the use of therapy scenes that advance both Will’s arc and the story. 

10. Strengths and Weaknesses 

• Strengths: 

1. Strong, well-developed characters, particularly Will and Sean. 



2. Witty, authentic dialogue that adds depth and realism. 

3. Emotional resonance throughout, especially in the therapy scenes. 

• Weakness: 

o At times, the pacing feels a bit slow, particularly in some of the quieter therapy 
sessions. While these scenes are essential for character development, they could 
have been more tightly edited to maintain momentum. 


